
                                                                               
 
                                                          STARS REPORT 33-2  
   NATIONAL SUMMARY                          PERIODIC TIMBER SALE ACCOMPLISHMENT REPORT                             PAGE:   1    
                                                          SUMMARY OF REGIONS                                        DATE: 11/06/90   
                                              FISCAL YEAR 1990:  ACCUMULATIVE AS OF  9/30/90                        TIME: 15:20 EST  
                                                                                                                  
==================================================================================================================================== 
                                                        CURRENT YEAR PROGRAM SUMMARY 
==================================================================================================================================== 
 
                                                    REGULAR             SALVAGE SALE FUND               BUY-BACK       TOTAL 
                                                    (17.1)                    (17.2)                     (17.3)  
                                               --------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 
                      FISCAL YEAR TARGETS:         8,887                   2,242                           -            11,129 
 
            I.  PROGRAM VOLUME ATTAINMENT:         7,489.600              2,496.609                    174.016 
            II.          VOLUME CANCELLED:            13.403                  6.741                      - 
            III.          LONG TERM SALES:           265.315                 22.218     
            IV. DELAYED OR WITHDRAWN(ALL):           176.490                 54.638                      0.228 
            V.      OFFERED (THRU GATE 4):            87.298                 17.376                      7.022   
            VI.                    NO BID:           140.576                217.427                      -                   
                                                 -----------            ------------                 ----------                     
                   FISCAL YEAR ATTAINMENT:         8,172.682              2,815.009                    181.266          11,168.957 
                   PERCENT ACCOMPLISHMENT:              92                  126                                            100.4 
 
 
==================================================================================================================================== 
                                            TARGETED SALES THRU GATE 5 OR 6 FOR REQUESTED PERIOD 
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :                            :          :                                      REGIONS 
NO:   ITEMS TO BE REPORTED     :   UNIT   :----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
  :                            : SUMMARY  :     1   :     2   :    3    :    4    :    5    :  6      :   8     :   9     :    10    
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :I. PROGRAM VOLUME ATTAINMENT:          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
 1: A. REGULAR PROGRAM         :  6,851.2 :   394.8 :   167.3 :   235.1 :   116.2 :   602.8 : 3,916.8 :   749.8 :  631.3  :    37.1  
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 2: B1. PERSONAL USE PERMITS   :    350.1 :    34.2 :    28.4 :    47.9 :    43.2 :    54.1 :    89.6 :    14.1 :   38.6  :     0.04 
  : B2. SMALL COMMERCIAL SALES :    239.2 :    19.7 :     7.9 :     9.2 :    17.9 :    28.6 :    32.7 :   123.2 :     -   :     0.05 
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
  : C. SALVAGE SALE FUND       :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
 3:  1. STANDARD (N.F.M.A)     :  2,319.4 :   208.6 :    97.4 :     1.4 :   209.7 :   611.5 :   838.8 :   312.0 :    36.8 :     3.2 
 4:  2. SSTS                   :    177.3 :     0.3 :     -   :     0.9 :     6.9 :   114.4 :    54.8 :     -   :     -   :      - 
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
 5: D. BUY-BACK SOLD           :    174.1 :    51.6 :    -    :    11.8 :     -   :    25.9 :    84.8 :     -   :     -   :      - 
==================================================================================================================================== 
 6:TOTAL VOLUME ATTAINED       : 10,160.2 :   709.2 :   301.0 :   306.4 :   393.9 : 1,436.2 : 5,017.5 : 1,199.0 :   756.7 :    40.3  
==================================================================================================================================== 
 7:II. VOLUMES CANCELLED       :     20.0 :     0.2 :     0.1 :     0.1 :     -   :    18.1 :     -   :     1.2 :     0.4 :     - 
==================================================================================================================================== 
 8:III. LONG TERM SALES        :    287.5 :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :   287.5  
 8aIII. SHORT TERM SALES       :     40.3 :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :    40.3  



 
 
 
 
 
 
                                                          STARS REPORT 33-2  
   REGIONS: ALL                               PERIODIC TIMBER SALE ACCOMPLISHMENT REPORT                             PAGE:   2    
                                                          FORESTS IN REGION                                         DATE: 11/06/90   
                                              FISCAL YEAR 1990:  ACCUMULATIVE AS OF  9/30/90                        TIME: 15:20 EST  
                                                           VOLUMES IN MBF(SAWTIMBER ONLY)    
==================================================================================================================================== 
                                                   ADDITIONAL PROGRAM VOLUME CREDITED    
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :                            :          :                                      REGIONS 
NO:   ITEMS TO BE REPORTED     :   UNIT   :----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
  :                            : SUMMARY  :     1   :    2    :    3    :    4    :    5    :    6    :    8    :    9    :   10 
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :IV. ADDITIONAL VOLUME       :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
  :                 CREDITED   :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
 9: A. DELAYED OR WITHDRAWN    :    231.3 :     6.7 :    31.7 :    11.7 :    41.3 :   117.1 :    61.9 :     0.4 :     1.8 :     -    
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
10: B. OFFERED (THRU GATE 4)   :    111.7 :    58.1 :     1.0 :     1.4 :     -   :    26.3 :    22.0 :     2.6 :     0.3 :     - 
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
11: C. NO BID REGULAR PROGRAM  :    140.7 :     9.0 :    26.4 :     9.2 :     9.3 :     2.1 :    27.4 :    36.9 :    15.8 :     4.6  
--:----------------------------:---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
  : D. NO BID SALVAGE SALE FUND:          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
12:  1. STANDARD (N.F.M.A)     :    212.6 :     2.6 :     9.4 :     0.1 :     1.7 :    45.3 :    23.7 :   123.9 :     -   :     5.9  
13:  2. SSTS                   :      4.9 :     -   :     -   :     -   :     1.2 :     0.8 :     2.9 :     -   :     -   :     - 
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
14: E. NO BID BUY-BACK         :      -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -   :     -    
====================================================================================================================================  
15:TOTAL ADDITIONAL CREDITED   :    701.1 :    76.3 :    68.6 :    22.3 :    12.1 :   191.6 :   137.9 :   163.8 :    17.9 :    10.5  
====================================================================================================================================  
16:TOTAL CURRENT YEAR          : 11,168.9 :   785.7 :   369.7 :   328.8 :   406.0 : 1,645.9 : 5,155.4 : 1,364.1 :   775.0 :   338.3  
==================================================================================================================================== 
  : FINAL FY 1990 TARGET       : 11,129   : 1,122   :   365   :   395   :   430   : 1,775   : 4,537   : 1,325   :   800   :   380 
 
  : PERCENT ACCOMPLISHMENT     :  100.4   :   70.0  :  101.3  :    83.2 :    94.4 :   92.7  :  113.6  :  102.9  :   96.9  :    89.1 
                                                                                                                                 
==================================================================================================================================== 
                                       SALES AWARDED FROM PREVIOUS FISCAL YEAR TARGETS (THRU GATE 6) 
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :V. ADDITIONAL VOLUME SOLD   :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
  :                 THIS YEAR  :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
17: A. REGULAR                 :  1,327.4 :    39.6 :   78.8  :    76.1 :    41.3 :   129.7 :   909.3 :    25.8 :     8.5 :    18.3  
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
18:                            :          :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :         :  
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
19: C. SALVAGE SALE FUND       :    189.1 :    27.9 :    8.8  :     0.3 :     1.1 :    29.6 :   117.1 :    -    :     3.8 :     0.3  
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
20: D. UNCOMPLETED, RESOLD     :     16.7 :     -   :    -    :     -   :     -   :    10.8 :     4.4 :    -    :     1.5 :     -    
====================================================================================================================================  
21:TOTAL ADDITIONAL SOLD       :  1,533.2 :    67.5 :    87.7 :    76.4 :    42.4 :   170.1 : 1,030.8 :    25.8 :    13.8 :    18.7  
====================================================================================================================================  
22:VI. TOTAL ACCOMPLISHMENT    : 12,702.1 :   853.2 :   457.4 :   405.2 :   448.4 : 1,815.9 : 6,186.2 : 1,389.9 :  788.8  :   353.0  
====================================================================================================================================



 
 
 
 
 
 
                                                          STARS REPORT 33-2  
   REGIONS: ALL                              PERIODIC TIMBER SALE ACCOMPLISHMENT REPORT                             PAGE:   3    
                                                          FORESTS IN REGION                                         DATE: 11/06/90   
                                              FISCAL YEAR 1990:  ACCUMULATIVE AS OF  9/30/90                        TIME: 15:20 EST  
                                                           VOLUMES IN MBF    
==================================================================================================================================== 
                                          HARVESTED(CUT) VOLUMES FOR REQUESTED FISCAL YEAR   
==================================================================================================================================== 
  :                            :          :                                      FOREST  
NO:   ITEMS TO BE REPORTED     :   UNIT   :----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
  :                            : SUMMARY  :     1   :    2    :    3    :    4    :    5    :    6    :    8    :    9    :   10 
====================================================================================================================================  
23:  1. VOLUME HARVESTED QTR-1 :  3,003.8 :   328.3 :   115.0 :   180.3 :   140.3 :   520.0 : 1,043.4 :   352.4 :   208.0 :   116.1 
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
24:  2. VOLUME HARVESTED QTR-2 :  1,630.3 :   207.4 :    78.4 :    53.3 :    57.7 :   130.9 :   512.9 :   293.0 :   208.8 :    87.9 
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
25:  3. VOLUME HARVESTED QTR-3 :  2,029.5 :   119.8 :    36.6 :    85.9 :    60.2 :   437.7 :   682.9 :   360.3 :   113.7 :   132.4 
--:----------------------------:----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------  
26:  4. VOLUME HARVESTED QTR-4 :  2,918.2 :   355.9 :    99.3 :   102.5 :   135.6 :   574.5 :   891.1 :   403.4 :   220.2 :   135.7  
====================================================================================================================================  
27:VII. VOLUME HARVEST TO DATE :  9,581.8 : 1,011.2 :   329.3 :   422.0 :   393.9 : 1,663.2 : 3,130.2 : 1,409.1 :   750.7 :   472.1  
==================================================================================================================================== 


